
BIDS RECEIVED 7/16/2024 AT 2:00 PM EST
BIDS OPENED 7/16/2024 AT 2:00 PM EST

Vendor Name 
Rohan 

International 
Zheng 

Commerce
CMAAG dba 

Hoopla
Jonah's 

Enterprise

MainConn 
Development 

LTD
Addenda Acknowledged (#1) yes yes yes yes yes
Bid Signed yes yes yes yes yes
Product Sample yes yes yes yes yes
Anti-Collusion/Non-Discrimination Form yes yes yes yes yes

Line Item 1 - [17 inch clear backpack (unit 
price/ total price)] $10.80 $12.88 $8.33 $13.99 $5.98

Line Item 2 - [16 inch clear backpack (unit 
price/total price)] $9.60 $12.97 $7.96 $7.99 $5.98

Freight (if applicable) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Grand Total $277,200.00 $248,840.00 $220,470.00 $305,730.00 $161,460.00

Delivery Date 8/19/2024 8/9/2024 8/19/2024 9/20/2024 8/19/2024

Notes: 

***Awarded 
based off 

delivery time 
and quality 

Delivery 8/19 if 
PO issued by 

7/22

Date after 
backpacks are 
required to be 
received

Clear Backpacks IFB 020-0-2024SNB

CONTRACTING OFFICER : SHANNON BAILEY, VCCO, VCO 



Lasting 
Impressions

Elianne Simms 
dba Creative 
Advertising 

GoOutdoor 
Amenities Inc Blink Swag 

Veterans Yielding 
Better 

Opportunities FSI Office 

Bernstein 
Lash 

Marketing 
Impression In 

Print 
no yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes

$8.69 $7.70 $18.59 $9.29 $3.24 $8.86 $7.99 $15.79

$6.56 $7.70 $13.39 $9.29 $3.21 $8.63 $7.99 $14.90

$0.00 $31,700.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$209,070.00 $239,600.00 $499,530.00 $200,830.00 $87,091.20 $236,460.00 $215,730.00 $415,614.00

8/19/2024 8/10/2024 8/22/2024 9/10/2024 8/26/2024 8/26/2024 8/23/2024 8/24/2024

Delivery date if 
PO is issued 7/19

Can meet 
delivery if notice 
of award issued 
7/19

Date after 
backpacks are 
required to be 
received

Can meet 
delivery if PO 

issued by 7/17



CaseTech 
Protectus 9 to 

5
Fyre 

Marketing 
Sterile Service 

co
US Promo 

Solutions LLC CDW-G
Gold Crown 

llc
School 

Specialty Blue Spoon UHC Modern Mart 
yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes no yes
yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes

$6.14 $13.99 $9.55 $6.32 $11.11 $24.70 no bid no bid $10.00 $14.00

$6.22 $13.99 $9.55 $6.32 $18.50 $23.50 no bid $11.88 $10.00 $12.50

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 no bid $59,760.00 $0.00 $0.00

$166,740.00 $377,730.00 $271,605.45 $170,640.00
499500 or 
299,970 $361,500.00 no bid $202,320.00 $270,000.00 $360,000.00

8/19/2024 8/19/2024 8/26/2024

4 weeks; 
delivery date 
not specified not listed; 8/15 to 8/20 no bid 8/19/2024

8-10 week 
lead time 8/23/2024

Could not 
meet 

delivery 
time



Gold Crown 
LLC

Melissa 
Holder

Victory 
Authority 

Corp
Revelae 
Group 

International 
Promotions 

DLA 
Promotions

Always 
Available 

Wholesalers
Fan Fit 

Faminig 
yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
yes yes yes yes yes no no yes
yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes

$13.00 $11.25 $6.95 $8.13 $15.00 $13.88 $7.59 $10.70

$15.00 $11.25 $5.25 $7.93 $15.00 $12.49 $7.10 $10.46

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $0.00

$381,000.00 $303,750.00 $167,250.00 $217,035.00 $405,000.00 $358,120.00 $199,300.00 $285,903.75

8/5/2024 8/16/2024 8/9/2024 9/12/2024 8/23/2024 9/20 - 9/25 8/1/2024 8/19/2024
Offered 
Alternate 
17inch option 
$13.65

No sample 
provided




	Sheet1

